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The WTO, Agriculture, and Developing 
Countries: The Need for Trade Reforms
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* Melissa Blue Sky is a JD Candidate, May 2011, at American University Wash-
ington College of Law.

The most recent collapse of World Trade Organization 
(“WTO”) negotiations occurred in July 2008 because 
countries were unable to reach an agreement on how to 

protect farmers in developing countries from the negative effects 
of greater trade liberalization.1 Although an attempt was made 
to restart talks in September 2008, little progress was made, and 
if talks are to continue, it will not likely be until 2009.2 The cur-
rent round of negotiations, titled the Doha Development Agenda 
(“DDA”), began in 2001 and included an emphasis on the needs 
of developing countries.3 However, subsequent negotiations 
have raised many questions about the commitment of developed 
countries to the DDA goals and highlighted the increasingly 
central role of agriculture in the WTO.

The Uruguay Round of negotiations, which continued from 
1986 until 1994, created both the WTO and the Agreement on 
Agriculture (“AoA”). Prior to the Uruguay Round, it was com-
monly believed that the international trade regime did not include 
agriculture. This can be traced to a 1955 waiver on agricultural 
import restrictions granted to the United States, which resulted 
in global disregard of trade rules.4 

The AoA firmly returned agriculture to the WTO trade 
regime with specific binding commitments regarding market 
access, domestic support, and export competition.5 Yet it does 
not take into consideration non-market aspects of agriculture 
and food markets, such as the relatively inelastic supply and 
demand in agriculture, the lack of political and economic power 
of farmers, and the fact that corporations rather than countries or 
farmers are the actors who engage in agricultural trade.6

The agricultural trade rules of the WTO have required lib-
eralization of developed country access to developing countries’ 
markets, but developed countries have not reciprocated by open-
ing their markets to agricultural products from developing coun-
tries. Tariffs levied by developed countries on products from 
developing countries increase the final product price, making it 
more difficult for developing countries to sell their agricultural 
products.7 Nor have developed countries sufficiently decreased 
their trade-distorting agricultural subsidies, which provide addi-
tional income to agricultural producers and allow them to sell 
their products for a lower price.8 As a result of these types of 
policies, developing country farmers are forced to compete 
with subsidized, larger foreign producers who may cause local 
producers to go out of business, increasing urban emigration, 
vulnerability of food-importing nations to swings in global com-
modity markets, and food insecurity.9

Commodity prices, which were quite low until relatively 
recently, coupled with the AoA’s unfair trade rules, have sig-
nificantly affected the ninety-six percent of the world’s farmers 
who live in developing countries and approximately 2.5 billion 
people who are dependent on agriculture as their main source of 
income.10 

Farmers in developing countries are negatively impacted 
when prices for their crops decline, which can result from trade 
liberalization.11 Conversely, consumers in developing countries 
generally benefit from lower food prices, because a large per-
centage of their income is spent on food.12 However, in many 
developing countries, households are both producers and con-
sumers of agricultural products and lower prices simultaneously 
lead to negative and positive effects.13 In subsistence farming 
households, the benefits of reduced food prices for consumption 
may not outweigh the losses of decreased profits from sale of 
their crops.14

Increased food prices have the greatest negative effects on 
people who spend a substantial portion of their incomes on food. 
When prices in staple food crops go up these people are forced 
to reduce either their food consumption or their purchases of 
other essentials. The recent food crisis has increased the num-
ber of people living in poverty by an estimated 100 million and 
led to widespread food riots.15 The number of people suffering 
from malnutrition increased by 119 million in 2007 and 2008, 
bringing the worldwide total to nearly one billion.16 Although 
increased food prices should lead to increased incomes for 
farmers in developing countries, for the most part this has not 
occurred because of increases in input prices, limited access to 
markets, and the fact that the minority of household producers 
are net sellers.17 

At the July 2008 WTO negotiations, parties reached an 
impasse because developing countries refused to move forward 
with an agreement that would deepen the inequities exacerbated 
by agricultural trade. Developing countries want to protect their 
farmers and their populations from poverty and hunger. The 
agricultural sector within developing countries is important for 
ensuring food security and for employment. In India, for exam-
ple, two-thirds of the population is supported by agriculture.18 

At the July negotiations, Susan C. Schwab, the U.S. Trade 
Representative, stated that the developing countries wanted an 
agreement that would take the global trading system back thirty 
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years.19 While this may be true in some respects, it ignores the 
fact that developing countries are not now industrialized to the 
degree that the United States was thirty years ago. Developed 
countries, like the United States, have demonstrated a contin-
ued unwillingness to recognize the role that protection played in 
their own economic development and to extend similar protec-
tions to developing countries. 

Developing countries’ concerns regarding unfair rules of 
trade in agriculture must be incorporated into any future WTO 
negotiations in order to contribute to rather than detract from 
progress on long-term development goals. Developed countries 
should reduce the subsidies given to domestic agricultural pro-
ducers, as well as the tariffs on agricultural imports from devel-
oping countries. It is also essential that countries recognize that 
trade may lead to food insecurity in developing countries and 
take measures to support both subsistence farmers and consum-
ers there.20 

Since the Doha Round began, developed countries have pro-
posed some reductions in their subsidies and to allow some of 
the poorest developing countries to maintain tariffs on a limited 
number of products.21 However, the developing country propos-
als do not go far enough to fulfill the objectives outlined by the 
Doha Ministerial Declaration, such as taking into account the 
development needs of non-industrialized nations, including food 
security and rural development.22 Developing countries should 
continue to work together to build agreements and power blocks 
to ensure that any future trade agreement embodies the original 
intent of the Doha Development Agenda.
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