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By Chloe Schalit1

ABSTRACT 

Right now, noncitizens only have the right to an 
attorney if they can afford one. While courts have 
grappled with the inherent due process issue 
accompanying this standard, no court has held that 
noncitizens have the right to a government-
appointed attorney. This paper promotes the 
provision of government-appointed attorneys to 
noncitizens in removal proceedings in immigration 
court under a due process lens. This paper will first 
briefly examine the difference between criminal and 
civil matters related to the Sixth Amendment right 
to an appointed attorney. Next, the paper will 
engage in a Fifth Amendment due process analysis, 
ultimately concluding that noncitizens' right to an 
appointed attorney during removal proceedings can 
qualify as a due process right under the Fifth 
Amendment. Finally, the paper will provide an 
overview of local programs that have been 
implemented to illustrate a blueprint for a national 
framework to expand noncitizens' right to 
representation.

INTRODUCTION

1
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The inability of noncitizens in removal proceedings 
to access court-appointed attorneys violates the Due 
Process Clause of the Fifth Amendment. 
Nonetheless, the Immigration and Nationality Act 
("INA") specifies that noncitizens in removal 
proceedings only have the right to an attorney "at no 
expense to the government."1 In addition, with the 
exception of unaccompanied children in long-term 
Office of Refugee Resettlement detention centers, 
noncitizen children also do not have the right to a 
government-appointed attorney.2 Therefore, 
attorney representation rates for noncitizens remain 
low.3 In 2016, sixty-five percent of noncitizens were 
represented by attorneys; in 2023, however, the 
representation rate dropped to thirty percent.4 

Research shows that noncitizens who are represented 
by an attorney have better outcomes than those who 
proceed pro se, with represented noncitizens being 
more likely to obtain relief and avoid deportation.5

Deportation has continued to impact more 
noncitizens, particularly after the Illegal Immigration 
Reform and Immigrant Responsibility Act of 1996 
("IIRIRA") was passed, which broadened the scope 
of immigration enforcement by increasing the 
number of criminal offenses that could lead to 
removal proceedings.6 Between 1996 and 1997, the 
number of noncitizens removed nearly doubled from 
69,680 individuals to 114,432 individuals, and has 
since continued to increase.7 Although the number of 
noncitizens removed has increased—likely due, in 
part, to the expansion of criminal deportability 
grounds—over ninety percent of noncitizens in 
immigration court are in removal proceedings due to 
immigration charges or entering without inspection, 
rather than criminal charges.8 Nonetheless, the 
number of noncitizens in removal proceedings— 
particularly for those whose options for relief are 
limited, based on aggravated felonies—has continued 
to grow; more particularly, for those without an 
attorney, many more noncitizens are now subject to 
deportation.

Advocates and attorneys, including the American Bar 
Association,9 endorse the expansion of the right to an 
appointed attorney for noncitizens in removal 
proceedings.10 However, under the Sixth 
Amendment, only defendants in criminal trials have 
the right to a government-appointed attorney; it does 
not apply to civil matters, like immigration.11 
Although a small group of individuals in civil 
proceedings have the right to court-appointed 
attorneys, this has not been broadened to the 
immigration context.12 However, although courts 
have held that noncitizens' due process rights are 
violated when a noncitizen does not voluntarily and 



REFUGEE LAW & MIGRATION STUDIES BRIEF | Volume 1 Issue 3 Spring 2024

knowingly waive their right to counsel, courts have 
not yet broadly held that both noncitizen children 
and adults have the right to a government-appointed 
attorney.13 Nonetheless, the analysis below outlines 
the legal arguments that can support a Fifth 
Amendment due process right to an appointed 
attorney for noncitizens in removal proceedings.14

Although noncitizens currently do not have the right 
to a government-appointed attorney, it was not until 
1963 that all criminal defendants had this right under 
the Sixth Amendment. Prior to 1963, courts 
interpreted the Sixth Amendment only to apply to 
federal criminal defendants; however, the Supreme 
Court has since expanded this right.15 In Gideon v. 
Wainwright, the Court held that the Sixth 
Amendment applied to federal and state criminal 
defendants.16 This set a new precedent based on the 
necessity of procedural and substantive safeguards 
for criminal defendants, and emphasized the 
importance of attorney representation in ensuring 
fair trials.17

However, based on precedent from the 1893 
Supreme Court case Fong Yue Ting v. United States, 
the Court does not consider deportation a 
punishment, but instead a civil and administrative 
enforcement mechanism, thereby preventing 
noncitizens from asserting a right to counsel under 
the Sixth Amendment.18 Nevertheless, in 2010, the 
Supreme Court in Padilla v. Kentucky recognized 
the close relationship between criminal convictions 
and immigration proceedings, acknowledging that 
"criminal convictions and the penalty of deportation" 
have been enmeshed for nearly a century.19 While 
the Court reaffirmed that immigration proceedings 
are civil and not criminal, it highlighted the 
significant penalty that deportation imposed on 
noncitizens.20 Consequently, advocates began 
pushing for a "Civil Gideon" to expand the right to 
appointed counsel to individuals in civil trials, 
including immigration.21 The following analysis uses 
the Due Process Clause of the Fifth Amendment to 
provide a framework for creating a "Civil Gideon" in 
the context of immigration removal proceedings.

2

Given the high stakes of removal proceedings and the 
significant disparities in outcomes for represented an 
unrepresented noncitizens, it is paramount for 
noncitizens in removal proceedings to have the right to 
a government-appointed attorney under the Due 
Process Clause. Although no court has yet held that 
noncitizens have this right, courts have 
acknowledged that lacking attorney representation in 
civil proceedings such as immigration implicates a 
Fifth Amendment due process analysis.22

Following the Court's decision in Mathews v. 
Eldridge, lower courts conducting a due  
process analysis engage in a case-by-case balancing 
test by balancing three factors: (1) the private interest 
that will be affected by the action; (2) the risk of 
an erroneous deprivation of such interest through the 
procedures used, and the probable value, if any, of 
additional or substitute procedural safeguards; and 
(3) the Government's interest, including the function 
involved, and the fiscal and administrative burdens 
that the additional or substitute procedural 
requirement would entail.23 These factors are applied 
below as they apply to immigration removal 
proceedings, establishing a feasible legal justification 
for holding that government-appointed attorney 
representation for noncitizens is a constitutional right 
under the Due Process Clause.

i. Private Interests

The private interests implicated in removal 
proceedings strongly favor the noncitizen. When 
analyzing the private interests factor, the Eldridge 
Court assessed the risk that the final decision or time 
period during an appeal without disability benefits 
could wrongfully deprive the applicant of his means to 
live.24 However, here, although some individuals in 
removal proceedings may have access to financial 
support during an appeal or after a final deportation 
order, the economic and social costs of deportation not 
only harms noncitizens, but also their families and 
communities. These impacts were highlighted in 
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Landon v. Plasencia where the court emphasized the 
noncitizen's strong interests that are at stake, 
including losing the right to live and work in the 
United States, and being disconnected from her 
family.25

Research further demonstrates the severe 
consequences of deportation on individual safety. A 
study from Human Rights Watch recently reported 
that at least 138 individuals deported between 2013 
and 2019 from the United States to El Salvador were 
killed, most often by gangs and law enforcement.26 
The study further uncovered at least 70 instances of 
sexual violence, torture, or abductions, often times at 
the hands of gangs.27 This illustrates that, particularly 
for noncitizens who have come to the United States 
based on danger they may face in their country of 
origin, the consequence of deportation is severe.

In addition to the danger that deportees may face, 
their families also face consequences.28 Often times, 
parents who are deported have U.S. citizen children 
who suffer challenges—including economic 
difficulty due to losing a source of the family's 
income, and the traumatic psychological impacts of 
being separated from a parent.29 Accordingly, the 
first Eldridge factor concerning the private interests 
at stake favors the noncitizen in terms of the potential 
dire individual, family, and community consequences 
of deportation.

Without an attorney, the risk of erroneous deprivation 
of rights is high, and the procedural safeguards in 
place currently are insufficient. Further, many 
noncitizens without an attorney may face deportation, 
which may not be the result if they are represented by 
an attorney. Although courts have held that a 
noncitizen may be erroneously deprived of their 
liberty interests if an immigration judge does not 
properly assess whether they need an interpreter, 
based on the potential for misinterpretation or an 
inaccurate factual finding,30 courts have not yet found 
that lack of attorney representation erroneously 
deprives a noncitizen of their due process rights.31 
However, the complexity of immigration law and 
evidence that noncitizens represented by attorneys 
receive better outcomes indicates that noncitizens in 
removal proceedings face a substantial  risk of being  

ii. Risk of Erroneous Deprivation and
Substitute Safeguards     

erroneously deprived of their rights when not 
represented by an attorney. 

First, the risk of erroneous deprivations of rights is 
high for noncitizens without attorney representation. 
Noncitizens represented by an attorney experience 
better outcomes than those without representation. 
Detained noncitizens with an attorney are twice as 
likely as those not represented to be granted 
immigration relief.32 Noncitizens who are not 
detained and who have an attorney are almost five 
times as likely to be granted relief.33 Overall, 
noncitizens represented by an attorney are also more 
likely to be released from detention, appear in court, 
win their removal cases, and request and receive relief 
from deportation.34 Furthermore, the complexity of 
immigration law has been acknowledged in court 
cases and articles alike: "With only a small degree of 
hyperbole, the immigration laws have been termed 
'second only to the Internal Revenue Code in 
complexity.' A lawyer is often the only person who 
could thread the labyrinth."35 A noncitizen, 
particularly a child, may not know about all the 
potential forms of relief for which they are eligible, or 
understand how to emphasize important facts to prove 
their case without the guidance of an attorney. 

Second, without attorney representation, the 
procedural safeguards currently in place are 
insufficient to protect noncitizens from erroneous 
deprivation of their rights. Immigration judges have a 
duty to facilitate the development of the record while 
remaining neutral arbiters, and DHS attorneys are 
supposed to seek justice rather than speedy removal.36 
However, removal proceedings often remain 
adversarial and pro se applicants face off against DHS 
attorneys with specific knowledge of immigration law 
and the resources of a federal agency.37 Without an 
attorney, noncitizens in removal proceedings are 
deprived of justice and a fair proceeding, and are 
more likely to receive worse outcomes than if they 
had been represented, therefore strengthening the 
argument that the second Eldridge factor favors 
the noncitizen. 

The government has an interest in effective and 
efficient removal proceedings, which attorney 
representation supports. Thus, the third Eldridge 
factor likely favors noncitizens. However, courts

iii. The Government's Interest
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conducting an Eldridge due process analysis in 
immigration proceedings often find that the facts 
favor the government. Courts usually specify two 
primary government interests: (1) the government's 
interest in "efficient administration of the immigration 
laws,"38 and (2) the financial burden that providing 
appointed counsel to noncitizens would impose on the 
government.39

First, attorney representation for noncitizens in 
removal proceedings can align with the government 
interest of efficient and effective administration of 
immigration law. Attorney representation has been 
found to improve the "efficiency, accuracy, and 
consistency" of immigration court decisions because 
detained noncitizens represented by attorneys are 
more likely to provide documents, claim proper relief, 
and make stronger legal arguments for their cases.40 
Second, looking comprehensively at the impact that 
attorney representation has on efficiency (as noted 
above), expanding attorney representation could save 
the government money in the long run. 

Moreover, noncitizens with attorneys "sought fewer 
unmeritorious claims, had a greater chance of being 
released from detention, and were more likely to 
appear at hearings following release," thus allowing 
for speedier proceedings.41 Attorney representation 
further reduces the number of days that detained 
noncitizens are in detention, because more noncitizens 
are likely to be released on bond, and noncitizens who 
are detained may be more likely to accept a 
deportation order if they hear from their attorney that 
they do not have a strong chance at relief.42 A study of 
the Legal Orientation Program ("LOP")—a program 
funded by the Executive Office for Immigration 
Review ("EOIR"), which provides legal workshops 
for detained noncitizens—found that the program 
saved approximately $19.9 million a year due in 
immigrant detention costs, a number that would likely 
be higher with full attorney representation for 
individuals.43 Therefore, appointing attorneys for 
noncitizens would promote government interests by 
improving the efficiency and effectiveness of 
immigration court proceedings. 

Although some individual cases may yield the same 
result whether or not the noncitizen is represented by

an attorney, generally, many noncitizens are 
prejudiced by a lack of attorney representation 
because the outcome of their case may have changed 
if they had been represented by an attorney.44 Even if 
all three Eldridge factors are construed in the 
noncitizen's favor, many courts require that a 
noncitizen claiming a due process violation also 
demonstrate that they have been prejudiced by the 
violation—in this case, not having an attorney.45 
Thus, noncitizens must prove that if they had been 
represented by an attorney, their case would not have 
resulted in deportation.46 Both the Board of 
Immigration Appeals ("BIA") and U.S. courts often 
contend that the noncitizen would have been 
deported regardless, and therefore an attorney likely 
would not have changed the outcome of the case.47 
However, while this assertion may be true for some 
individuals, it is very unlikely to be the case for all 
noncitizens, particularly given the complexity of 
immigration law and the variety of potential 
outcomes possible.48 Furthermore, there is value to 
attorney representation beyond the result of the case. 
As outlined above, attorney representation increases 
the efficiency of proceedings, thus improving the 
entire process. Accordingly, both the process and 
outcome of immigration proceedings are likely to be 
impacted by attorney representation for many 
noncitizens in removal proceedings.

When declining to find that noncitizens' lack of 
government-appointed attorneys during removal 
proceedings is a due process violation, courts often 
use a separation of powers rationale and defer to 
Congress' wording in the INA; however, not having 
an attorney during a removal proceeding is a due 
process violation squarely under the jurisdiction of 
the courts.49 The Supreme Court has continued to 
emphasize that the role of courts, particularly 
pertaining to immigration, "does not extend to 
imposing procedures that merely displace 
congressional choices of policy."50 Courts claim that 
if they granted noncitizens a due process right to 
appointed counsel, the courts would be usurping 
Congress by going beyond its role to merely "say 
what the law is."51 However, because the lack of 
attorney representation for noncitizen appears to be a 
due process violation, it should be the courts' role to 
implement this constitutional requirement.
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that an experienced attorney would have. 
Nonetheless, ARs likely require fewer financial 
expenditures than universal attorney representation 
and may provide stronger support for noncitizens 
than LOPs because the representation is 
individualized and comprehensive.

The justice AmeriCorps (jAC) Legal Services for 
Unaccompanied Children Program ran from January 
2015 until August 2017, and provided government 
funding to support staff to represent unaccompanied 
children in immigration court through an 
AmeriCorps program.60 Although some participants 
felt challenged by the strict eligibility requirements 
for clients, and the relatively short one-year term of 
service, the program substantially increased attorney 
repreentation for unaccompanied children and 
improved outcomes for represented individuals, thus 
providing an example of a more short-term program 
that could bridge the gap between the present 
scheme and a constitutional right to attorney 
representation.61

Universal representation programs have been 
implemented on a smaller scale and demonstrate the 
impact that a potential national program could have. 
The New York Immigrant Family Unity Project 
("NYIFUP") provides representation for noncitizens 
who are detained and are facing deportation by 
directing government funding to established 
organizations so they can expand their support 
network.62 The American Friends Service 
Committee ("AFSC") Friends Representation 
Initiative of New Jersey ("FRINJ") is a similar 
program that provides representation twice a week to 
all detained individuals under a certain income 
threshold who appear before a specific immigration 
court.63 The Midwest Immigrant Defenders Alliance 
("MIDA") provides representation to individuals in 
immigration detention and in court proceedings at 
the Chicago Immigration Court.64 This program was 
initiated in 2022 as an expansion of the universal 
representation model to additional states, 
demonstrating the strength and success of these local 
programs thus far.65 These programs have 
successfully provided universal representation to 
noncitizens in removal proceedings within the 

5

The intractability of this issue appears, in part, based 
on the assumption that providing government-
appointed attorneys to noncitizens in removal 
proceedings is administratively impossible, with both 
legislative52 and judicial actions yet to take hold on 
the federal level. However, the next section 
demonstrates that successful programs already 
implemented provide a framework for an expanded 
system of attorney representation at the federal level.

As of 2018, LOPs are administered by the EOIR 
within the Department of Justice ("DOJ") were 
available in thirty-eight detention centers across 
twelve states.53 LOPs provide group orientations to 
detained noncitizens with the following legal 
information: a general overview of immigration court 
processes, limited individual intakes allowing 
noncitizens to ask specific questions about their cases, 
self-help workshops allowing noncitizens to interact 
with other individuals seeking similar forms of relief, 
guidance on specific legal topics, and referrals to pro 
bono attorneys.54 Studies have shown that LOPs 
increase the efficiency of immigration court 
proceedings, better prepare noncitizens for their 
hearings, and generally lead to more favorable 
outcomes.55 LOPs balance limiting financial 
expenditures with supporting noncitizens, although 
they are not necessarily a substitute for an attorney 
who can provide specific and comprehensive legal 
advice for each individual client.56

Organized be the EOIR, an accredited representative 
("AR") is a non-attorney who works for a recognized 
non-profit and is considered qualified to represent 
noncitizens in immigration court.57 ARs' role in 
immigration court proceedings closely mirrors that of 
an attorney. ARs can form a direct relationship with 
the client, speak on their behalf in immigration 
proceedings, and file documents with the court.58 The 
AR program also allows individuals who may not be 
able to access law school become immigration 
advocates.59 However, although ARs are experienced 
professionals in the immigration field, they still may 
lack the nuanced understanding of immigration law  



REFUGEE LAW & MIGRATION STUDIES BRIEF | Volume 1 Issue 3 Spring 2024

programs' area of work.66

Due process requires that noncitizens in removal 
proceedings be provided the right to a government-
appointed attorney. The percentage of noncitizens 
without representation leaves noncitizens in a 
perpetual state of being denied fair and adequate 
hearings. Not only would expanding representation 
align with due process based on above analysis of 
the Eldridge factors, but it would also be 
administratively and financially efficient. Smaller 
scale programs outlined above demonstrate that it is 
possible to expand the reach of representation for 
noncitizens, and that the country could do so on a 
national scale. Although courts tend to defer to the 
executive and legislative powers on immigration 
matters, this should not stop courts from intervening 
when there are clear due process violations.

6
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